
REGULAR SESSION TUESDAY SEPTEMBER 24, 2013 

The Board of Huron County Commissioners met this date in Regular Session.  Roll being called found the 
following members present: Gary W. Bauer, Tom Dunlap, Joe Hintz.    
 
Pursuant to Ohio Revised Code Section 305.14 the Record of the Proceedings of the September 17, 2013 
& September 19, 2013 meeting(s) were presented to the Board. Tom Dunlap made the motion to waive the 
reading of the minutes of the September 17, 2013 and September 19, 2013 meeting(s) and approve as 
presented. Joe Hintz seconded the motion. Voting was as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
13-311 
 

IN THE MATTER OF CERTIFYING CLAIMS SCHEDULES TO THE HURON COUNTY 

AUDITOR FOR PAYMENT 

 

 Joe Hintz moved the adoption of the following resolution: 
 

WHEREAS, as per Ohio Revised Code 305.10, a resolution must be made by the Board of Huron County 
Commissioners to accompany the Claims Schedule to the Huron County Auditor’s Office for payment;now therefore 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners does hereby approve Claim 
Schedule C 13-37 authorize the Huron County Auditor to make the necessary warrants; and further  

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
 
Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
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13-312 
  

IN THE MATTER OF APPROVING OF THE HURON COUNTY REVOLVING LOAN FUND 

SEMI-ANNUAL REPORT 
 
Tom Dunlap moved the adoption of the following resolution: 
 

WHEREAS, the Huron County Revolving Loan Fund Semi-Annual Report for the first half of 2013 has 
been prepared by WSOS Community Action, Inc. and submitted to the Board of Huron County 
Commissioners for their approval; and 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Huron County Commissioners has reviewed the Huron County Revolving Loan 
Fund Semi-Annual Report for the first half of 2013 and has found that to the best of their knowledge the 
data in the report as attached herein has been verified to be true and correct as of the date of this report;now therefore 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of the Huron 
County Revolving Loan Fund Semi-Annual Report for the first half of 2013; and further 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Huron County Revolving Loan Fund Semi-Annual Report for 2013 be made 
a part of this resolution hereof the same as if fully written herein; and further 
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BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
 
Joe Hintz seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
* Report on file. 
 
13-313 

 

IN THE MATTER OF AUTHORIZING APPROPRIATION ADJUSTMENTS WITHIN THE 

GENERAL FUND #008; #017 #027  

 

Joe Hintz moved the following resolution: 
 

WHEREAS, there is a need for appropriation adjustments; and 
 

WHEREAS, the Board of Huron County Commissioners finds the request to be reasonable;  
 now therefore 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves the following 
appropriation adjustments: 
FROM:     Dept.    Account   Fund     Amount    TO:   Dept. Account    Fund     Amount 
                  008           00290     001      $2,150.00                  008   00400       001       $2,150.00       
                                Data Processing    PERS 
                   008           00175     001    $1,000.00                      008    00360      001         $2,000.00 
                                  Supplies   Transcripts 
                  008          475        001       $1,000.00 
                                  Other Expenses 
                  017          00475    001     $   605.00                       017                00400       001      $   605.00 
                                  Other Expenses                                                            PERS 

    027           00200      001       $670.00                     027               00400       001           $670.00 

                      Equipment                                                                  PERS                    and further  
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Huron County Auditor is authorized and instructed to record said 
appropriation adjustment as approved;                                                                        and further 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Clerk of the Board is instructed to certify a copy of this resolution to the 
Huron County Auditor and the department requesting said adjustment; and further 

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
                                      
Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows:  
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
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IN THE MATTER OF TRANSFERRING FUNDS FROM ACCOUNT #002 IN THE GENERAL 

FUND TO FUND #024 
 
Tom Dunlap moved the adoption of the following resolution: 
 

WHEREAS, a transfer of funds is needed for the #024 recorder’s fund;                now therefore 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of the transfer of 
moneys from 002-00400-001 PERS in the amount of $50.00 to the #024-00400-001 PERS;  and further 
 

BE IT RESOLVED,  that a certified copy of this resolution be sent to the Department requesting transfer, 
and the Huron County Auditor, and the Auditor’s office will make the journal entry to the # 024 account;and further  
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
 
Joe Hintz seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
13-315 
  

IN THE MATTER OF APPROPRIATING UNAPPROPRIATED FUNDS IN THE AUTO TAX 

FUND #125 

 
Joe Hintz moved the adoption of the following resolution: 

 

WHEREAS, there are unappropriated funds in the Auto Tax Fund #125 that need to be appropriated for 
expenses; now therefore 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of appropriating 
$200,000.00 of unappropriated funds as follows: 
 
TO: 125-00526-126 Contract/Projects  $200,000.00                                      and further 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
 
Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
13-316 

 

IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING BIDS FOR CERTAIN TYPES OF ASPHALT 

RESURFACING IN HURON COUNTY  

 

Tom Dunlap moved the adoption of the following resolution:  

WHEREAS, the Huron County Engineer requested the Board of Commissioners to seek bids for various 



REGULAR SESSION TUESDAY SEPTEMBER 24, 2013 

forms of asphalt resurfacing;                                                                                                              and 
 

WHEREAS, notice was placed in a newspaper of general circulation on Friday, September 6th, 2013, and 
Friday, September 13th, 2013 pursuant to Section 307.86 of the Ohio Revised Code and otherwise could be 
found on the Commissioners website at http://www.hccommissioners.com; 
 

WHEREAS, the bids were opened on Friday, September 20th, 2013 at the appointed time with prices 
presented as listed below: 

Hot Mix Erie Gerken A.J. Riley 

Mainline 

Surface with 64.95 67.67 62.50 

Surface without 72.85 72.92 72.50 

 

Intermediate with 59.75 66.32 54.90 

Intermediate without 67.50 71.32 63.90 

251 – 500 

Surface with 87.00 77.67 72.00 

Surface without 95.00 83.92 83.00  

 

Intermediate with 76.00 73.88 64.90 

Intermediate without 84.00 78.88 74.90 

Up To 250 

Surface with 99.25 101.48 77.90 

Surface without 108.00 107.73 86.50 

 

Intermediate with 88.00 95.48 70.00 

Intermediate without 108.00 100.48 78.49 

Chip and Seal Bergman Erie  

#8 @ .25 p/t No Bid 20.00  

 

#9 @ .22 2/t No Bid 17.00  

 

HFRS-2 p/g No Bid 2.68  

MC-3000 p/g No Bid 3.55  

Fog Seal Bergman Erie  

Per gallon no bid 3.50  

Per mile no bid 3,696.00                                                                                   now therefore         

 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Commissioners does hereby award the bid for Hot Mix Asphalt 

resurfacing to: A.J. Riley, Inc. 151 Akron Road, Norwalk, Ohio of receiving bids for various forms of 

resurfacing efforts in Huron County, Ohio; and for any selected Chip and Seal efforts to: Erie Blacktop, Inc., 
4507 Tiffin Avenue, Sandusky, Ohio; and to Erie Blacktop, Inc for any Fog Seal application;                            
                                                                                                                                                       and further 
  

BE IT RESOLVED, that once awarded, and selected efforts for the various forms of resurfacing be 

coordinated by and administered through the County Engineer’s Office;                                       and further      

                                                                                                     
BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the Board 
of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open to the 
public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised 
Code. 
                                              
Joe Hintz seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
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IN THE MATTER OF AWARDING THE BID FOR THE SUPPLY OF ROAD SALT (de-ICING) 

Tom Dunlap moved the adoption of the following resolution:  
 

WHEREAS, the Huron County Engineer requested the Commissioners seek bids for the supply of ROAD 

SALT (de-ICING);                                                                                                                                   and 

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 307.86 of the Ohio Revised Code, notice of this bid was placed in a 
newspaper of general circulation, on Friday, September 6th, 2013 and Friday September 13th, 2013 and 

notice could also be found on the County’s website at http://www.hccommissioners.com with bids being 
opened at the offices of the Board of Commissioners at 11:00 a.m. on Friday, September 20th, 2013;          
                      now therefore         

BE IT RESOLVED, bids were received from the firms and at the prices presented below:                              
                                                                                                                                             
Cargill De-Icing Technology, 24950 Country Club Blvd., Suite 450, North Olmstead, Ohio 44070; 

Morton Salt, 123 North Wacker Drive, Chicago, Illinois, 60606-1743; and North American Salt 

Company, 9900 West 109th Street, Suite 100, Overland Park, Kansas, 66210: 

 
                            Cargill        Morton      North American     2012       ’13 ODOT Delivered     
       34.74               34.30          44.88                  37.71         34.32  

Picked-up            35.00              33.00          41.00                   33.00         (Cargill)  
                                                                 @ Sandusky                                       (Morton) 

                                                      and further    

                                       
BE IT RESOLVED; that the Board of Commissioners does hereby award the bids for the supply of ROAD 

SALT (de-ICING) in Huron County for the contract term ending, April 9th, 2014, to: Morton Salt, 123 North 

Wacker Drive, Chicago, IL: with such bid being coordinated through and by the Office of the County 
Engineer;                                                                                                                                        and further        

                                                                                                                                           
BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the Board 
of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio, relating thereto were conducted in meetings open to the 
public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio Revised 
Code. 
                                              
Joe Hintz seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
13-318 
 

IN THE MATTER OF APPROVING OF A REQUEST FOR PAYMENT ON LETTER OF 

CREDIT AND STATUS OF FUNDS REPORT (FORM DS5) FOR HURON COUNTY 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT (B-F-12-1BJ-1) SUBMITTED TO THE 

BOARD SEPTEMBER 24, 2013 

 
Joe Hintz moved the adoption of the following resolution: 
 

WHEREAS,  a request for payment and status of funds report has been prepared and submitted to the 
Board of Huron County Commissioners as attached herein by WSOS CAC, Inc. & Huron County 
Development Council for the Board’s certification; and 
 

WHEREAS the Board has reviewed the request for payment and status of funds report; now therefore 
 

BE IT RESOLVED, that the Board of Huron County Commissioners hereby approves of the request for 
payment and status of funds report as attached herein and certifies that the data reported is correct and that 
the amount of the Request for Payment is not in excess of current needs; and further 
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BE IT RESOLVED, that the foregoing resolution was adopted and all actions and deliberations of the 
Board of Commissioners of the County of Huron, Ohio relating thereto were conducted in meetings open 
to the public, in compliance with all applicable legal requirements, including Section 121.22 of the Ohio 
Revised Code. 
 
Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows: 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 

 
 

IN THE MATTER OF TRAVEL 

Joe Hintz moved to approve the following travel requests this day.  Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  
The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows; 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 
 
Commissioners, Cheryl Nolan, to Fremont, Ohio on September 26, 2013 for Quarterly Six County 
meeting. 
 
Gary Ousley, Dog Warden, to Sandusky, Ohio, Menards, for materials for floor. 
 

IN THE MATTER OF REQUEST FOR LEAVE 

Valerie Stebel/Commissioners/Sick/8:00 a.m. – 12:00 p.m. September 19, 2013. 

Vickie Ziemba/Commissioners/Flex/3:00 p.m. – 4:30 p.m. September 27, 2013. 

Christina Norton/EMA/Sick/11:15 a.m. – 2:30 p.m. September 20, 2013. 

Jason Roblin/EMA/Vacation/8:00 a.m. – 4:30 p.m. September 23, 2013. 

Joshua Jasinski/Dog Warden/Sick/8:00 a.m. – 4:30 p.m. September 27, 2013. 

Gary Ousley/Dog Warden/Sick/8:00 a.m. – 4:30 p.m. September 23, 2013. 
 

At 9:30 a.m. Public Comment 
Don Frankenfield spoke in regards to the Huron County Airport. Mr. Frankenfield would like to discuss 
the previous money issues and would like to try and get this issue resolved. The money issue will not be 
forgiven per Mr. Bauer.  

 

At 9:45 a.m. the board recessed. 
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At 10:00 a.m. regular session resumed. 
 
Sheriff Dane Howard came before the board in regards to his 2014 budget along with transfers for the 
2013 budget.   
 
Sheriff Howard discussed the high visibility grant and asked to have the board front the funds for this 
grant. Sheriff Howard explained that the state assigns certain dates for extra patrol which include; Super 
Bowl Sunday, Thanksgiving and Christmas. Sheriff Howard explained that this grant will be utilized for 
payroll for the extra patrol the state requires. 
 
Fund #023 for 2014 the sheriff no longer lets deputies that live out of the county drive their cruisers home. 
Sheriff Howard explained that due to the wear and tear on the vehicles along with the gas prices, he no 
longer lets deputies drive their cruisers home.  
 
Scan reports asked for funding to hire additional Corrections Officers and dispatchers.  Sheriff Howard 
explained the reason for the additional hiring dispatchers and corrections officers is because they not 
within standards regarding man power within the department. Corrections Officers are mandated by the 
State of Ohio, there are standards regarding the amount of Corrections Officers needed for a jail the size of 
Huron County. At this time we are not within the standards; Huron County failed the inspection by the 
State of Ohio for 2012. 
 
Sheriff Howard explained the Courthouse staff #036 the standards, reports and increase for a dispatcher. 
 
Sheriff explained the layoffs and budget cuts #052 funds. Sheriff Howard explained that they lost a total 
sixteen employees. New funding will stream inmate housing program where inmates from other counties 
are housed at the Huron County Jail to help fund the facility. Mr. Dunlap questioned how much do you 
think we will bring in? Sheriff Howard explained it’s a balancing act. Mr. Dunlap stated that starting next 
year, at budget down that everyone is one the same page. A line of communication needs to be established. 
 
Sheriff Howard discussed the buying of six used cars next year rather than six new cars. Sheriff Howard 
suggested six used cars that could last a couple of years. Mr. Dunlap questioned where would you get these 
cars? Sheriff Howard explained that they have done some research, may have to go out of state to pick 
them up. Mr. Bauer questioned how long does it take to take ownership regarding cars that are confiscated 
during a drug bust? Sheriff Howard explained it takes years. 
 

At 10:30 a.m. Tom Dunlap moved to enter into Executive Sessions ORC 121.22 (G) (1) to consider the 

appointment, employment, dismissal, discipline, promotion, demotion, or compensation of a public 
employee or official, or the investigation of charges or complaints against a public employee, official, 

licensee, or regulated individual; ORC121.22 (G) (6) Specialized details of security arrangements where 
disclosure of the matters discussed might reveal information that could be used for the purpose of 
committing, or avoiding prosecution for a violation of the law.   
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 

 

At 10:49 a.m. Tom Dunlap moved to end Executive Sessions ORC 121.22 (G) (1) and ORC 121.22 (G) 
(6).  Joe Hintz seconded the motion.  The roll being called upon its adoption, the vote resulted as follows. 
 
       Aye – Gary W. Bauer 
       Aye – Tom Dunlap 
       Aye – Joe Hintz 

At 10:52 a.m. Katherine Ezawa, The Shelter came before the board to present the annual report to the 
board. Ms. Ezawa explained the domestic violence shelter in Mansfield. Ms. Ezawa explained they are 
doing more awareness activities to notify the public that there is a shelter in the area. October is victim 
awareness month. Mr. Bauer questioned how many people did they have direct contact with this year? Ms. 
Ezawa explained that they worked with a mother and her five children. Ms. Ezawa explained that they 
have 20 crisis calls. Ms. Ezawa explained the calls are mostly in the Willard, Norwalk area. 

 

At 11:09 a.m.  The board recessed. 
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At 11:15 a.m.  Sharon Locke, Tom Gerrity, and members of the Board of Election’s board came before 
the board in regards to presenting their 2014 budget. Ms. Locke explained the Board of Elections 
reimbursement and education fund. The fund shall be used by the secretary of state to reimburse boards of 
elections for various purposes, including reimbursements made under sections 3513.301, 3513.312, 
3515.071, and 3521.03 of the Revised Code, and to provide training and educational programs for 
members and employees of boards of elections. The fund shall receive transfers of cash pursuant to 
controlling board action and also shall receive revenues from fees, gifts, grants, donations, and other 
similar receipts.  
 

At 11:42 a.m.  Tom Lockwood, Peck Schaffer came before the board and stated the purpose of the hearing 
for the FTMC tax exempt bonds. Mr. Lockwood explained under ORC 140.08, in order to issue tax 
exempt bonds the bonds under the federal tax code, they have to be issued by a subdivision. In order for 
the county is issue the bonds under state law they have to have a property interest. The borrower, Fisher 
Titus would lease the property to the County, who would sublease the property back to Fisher-Titus to pay 
the debt. The county would enter into a trust adventure with a trustee. Once the county has entered into the 
trust adventure, Fisher-Titus will then pay back the debt. 

 

HEARING     FTMC ISSUANCE BONDS 

     

At 11:53 a.m. Gary Bauer, President called for testimony once in favor of approving the issuance of bonds 
not to exceed $60,000,000.00 series A and series B. Mr. Bauer called twice for testimony in favor of 
approving the issuance of bonds not to exceed $60,000,000.00 series A and series B, hearing none called 
thrice for testimony in favor of approving the issuance of bonds not to exceed $60,000,000.00 series A and 
series B, hearing none Mr. Bauer called once for testimony against such project, hearing none called twice 
for testimony against such project, hearing none called thrice for testimony against such project, hearing 
none Mr. Bauer closed the hearing.   
 
13-319    
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At 12:05 p.m.  Joe Hintz moved to adjourn.  Tom Dunlap seconded the motion.  The meeting stood 
adjourned.  

 

IN THE MATTER OF OPEN SESSION 

 
The board Huron County Commissioners hereby attest that all actions and deliberations of the Board 
legally required to be public were conducted in an open session on this date and that the foregoing minutes 
represent the official action of the Board. 
 
 

IN THE MATTER OF CERTIFICATION 
The Clerk to the Board does hereby attest that the foregoing is a true and correct record of all actions taken 
by the Board of Huron County Commissioners on September 24, 2013.                
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IN THE MATTER OF ADJOURNING 
 
The meeting was called to order at 9:00 a.m.  With no further business to come before the Board, the 
meeting was adjourned at 12:05 p.m.    
 
 

Signatures on File 

 


